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[CONSOLIDATED SIA TENDER QUERIES] 

APPENDIX F – TENDER CLARIFICATION FORM 

KUALA LUMPUR HIGH SPEED RAIL PROJECT 

 

REQUEST FOR CLARIFICATION (2) 

No. 
Reference No. (Item 

of the Tender 
Document) 

Question Response Date 

26 Item 5 (TOR – 11) 

We would like to know if the Health and safety 
Plan is meant for the project team of study (as 
consultant)  
 
 

No. The Health and Safety Plan as stated under 
Section 5 (TOR – 11) is required to be submitted 
by the appointed consultant to MyHSR Corp 
prior to the commencement of any activities. 
This is to ensure the SIA Consultant can 
demonstrate the best practice to conduct the SIA 
activities in compliance to the Health and Safety 
requirement.  

30 November 2017 

27 
Item 3.5.2 (TOR – 

3.5) 

It is mentioned in the TOR that interfaces 
Management Plan and Interface Document 
Control are to be prepared based on the Interface 
Management Procedure issued by MYHSR Corp. 
We Would appreciate it if you can clarify on this 
matter and if not too much, share with us the said 
document since it’s not included with the other 
documents in the pen drive.  
 

The Interface Management Plan and Internal 
Document Control will be given upon 
appointment of SIA Consultant. The referred 
documents indicate the interface procedure that 
need to be complied to obtain necessary 
information, i.e. from the engineering aspect, 
environmental aspect, etc. for the SIA study in 
ensuring the information shared is updated and 
is from the trusted source. 

30 November 2017 

 


